"OWN OF WARWICK

132 KINGS HIGHWAY | BUILDING & PLANNING DEPT (34 986~ 1107,

WARWICK, NEW YORK 10990 FAX NO. (845 OB 7~ 50
BUILDING DEPT EXL258/2
PLANNING DEPT ExXL26 1
ENGINEER EX1.259

Town Supervisor

Town Board
RE: 8-2-100
29 Sunrise Ridge

Dear Supervisor/Town Board:

The Building Department has received a reqiestf6m SolarCity for a
reimbursement of a permit fee that was paid for a solar permit application at the above
parcel. The work will not be performed. :

Per our Town Code we will retain $100.00 application fee; therefore, we sugge st
returning permit fee of $65.00.

Sincerely,

%

ayne Stevens
Building Inspector

C/c: Bookkeeping

WS/sw



- SQLAR.PANELS PERMIT

Town of Warwick Permit #: 23751
132 Kings Highway
Warwick, NY 10990
845-986-1127

S-B-L #: 8-2-100

File Date: 12/26/2014
Expiration Date: 12/26/20156

Location: 29 SUNRISE RIDGE

A Permit is hereby given by the Building Department, TOWN OF WARWICK, ORANGE COUNTY, for the structure
described herein:

Qwner Information:..

Milz, Bryan & Milz, Janine

29 Sunrise Rdg

Florida, NY 10921

Contacts:

CONTRACTOR

SOLARCITY CORPORATION
203 RIDGEWQOD DR
ELMSFORD, NY 10523

Work Description: SOLAR PANELS
5.865 KW SOLAR PV ARRAY ON EXISTING ROOF.

Cost of Construction: $12668.40
Fee§:

BUILDING PERMIT - MINOR NO C/O REQUIRED $165.00

Total Paid: $165.00
IMPORTANT

The owner/contractor shall adhere to all State and Local Codes and Ordinances.

2. A permit under which no work has commenced within one (1) year after issuance, shall expire by limitation,
and a new permit must be secured before work can begin.

3. It is the responsibility of the owner and/or contractor to comply with all applicable ordinances and to call for

the required inspections at jeast one day in advance.

4 When work is complete contact Building Department for final inspection for Certificate of Occupancy (which
application must be applied/paid for) or Certificate of Compliance.

5 Please call Orange & Rockland Utilities, Inc. at 811 prior to any digging on your property.

Z/ o

-

BUILDING INSPECTOR



FR

October 22, 2015

Michael Sweeton, Supervisor
Town of Warwick

132 Kings Highway

Warwick, New York 10990

Re: Survey Proposals for Taylor Road 2 Culvert Replacement Project

Dear Supervisor Sweeton:

A Request for Proposal (RFP) was sent to three surveying companies for surveying and
mapping work related to the culvert replacement for the Taylor Road 2 project; the proposals
were due on October 22, 2015.

One proposal was received with two surveyors combmmg together for a joint effort; the costs
are shown below. Copies of each proposal are included as attachments to this letter. Please
refer to the proposals for a detailed breakdown of each cost.

TAYLOR ROAD 2 CULVERT SURVEY
Company. Total Cost
Schmick Surveying, Inc. in conjunction with John A. McGloin, P.L.S $4,400.00

Recommendation: Based on the proposals submitted, | recommend that the Town contract "
with Schmick Surveying, Inc. in conjunction with John A. McGloin, P.L.S for a cost of
$4,400 (Brady Road).

. Sincerely,

Henningson, Durham & Richardson
Architecture and Engineering, P.C.
in association with HDR Engineering, Inc.

aura A. Barca, P.E.
Project Manager

hdrinc.com

1 International Boulevard, Suite 1000, Mahwah, New Jersey 07495
T(201)335-9300 F (201) 335 - 9301



SCHMICK SURVEYING, INC.
PROFESSIONAL LAND SURVEYING
Licensed in New York

_ Telephone .  (845) 986-8272
3 Forester Avenue, Warwick New York 10990 Facsimile ~  (845) 986-9298

October 21, 2015

HDR Engineering
7 Coates Drive, Suite 2
Goshen, NY 10924

Attn: Laura A. Barca, P.E.

Re: HDR Project:
Taylor Road Culvert Repair Project Survey
Town of Warwick

SCHMICK SURVEYING, INC. IS PLEASED TO PROVIDE THIS PROPOSAL IN
CONJUNCTION WITH JOHN A. MCGLOIN, P.L..S. TO DO THE FOLLOWING:

Survey and mapping for a culvert replacement project along Taylor Road
within the Town of Warwick as detailed in your “Survey.Scope of Work” for the
above referenced project, dated October 16, 2015.

Work shall begin within a week of awarding the project to us, with delivery
of a map in approximately 30 days from the award.

FEE: $4,400.00

Thank you for your consideration

ROBERT H. SCHMICK JR, PLS
JOHN A. MCGLOIN, PLS



Barca, Laura A.

From: : Jeff Doolittle <jbdoolittle@msn.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2015 4:22 PM
To: ‘ Barca, Laura A.

Subject: RE: Taylor Road 2

Laura,

Thank you for including me on your invitation to bidders list for this project. Unfortunately because of my
current work load, | am unable to submit a proposal to you at this time.

| do look forward to working with you and the Town of Warwick on other projects in the future.
Sincerely,
Jeffrey B. Doolittle, P. E. & L. S.

- 200 Route 17, Suite 116
Mahwah, New Jersey 07430

From: Laura.Barca@hdrinc.com

To: jbdoolittle@msn.com

Subject: Taylor Road 2

Date: Fri, 16 Oct 2015 19:53:03 +0000

Jeff,

Please find attached a request for a survey proposal at the Taylor Road 2 project. A response is requested by Thursday,
October 22™. The response can be emailed back to me. Please let me know if you have questions.

Thanks,
Laura

Laura A. Barca, PE

‘Project Manager

HDR

1 International Boulevard

10th Floor, Suite 1000

Mahwah, New Jersey 07495

D (201) 335 - 9473 F (201) 335 ~ 9301
Front Desk (201) 335 - 9300
Laura.Barca@hdrinc.com
hdrinc.com/follow-us




PLEASE TAKE NOTICE that the Planning Board of the Village of Florida will
hold a public hearing at the Village Hall, 33 South Main Street, Florida, N.X. on October
28, 2015 at 7:30 PM, or as soon thereafter as the matter can be heard, to consider the
application of Rosenberg Land Development, LLC, for a 57 lot subdivision of 95.7 +
acres of land known as Glemmere Presexrve and located off of NYS RE17A and Glenmere
Homesites Rd. and designated on the Village of Florida Tax Map as Sec. 113, Block 4,
Lots 2.1, 2.2, 7.2 and 16.

All interested persons will be given an opportunity to be heard at:the above time

anel place.

BY ORDER OF THE PLANNING BOARD

ROBERT SCOTT, Chairman




LAZER Z2° E-SERIES

MODEL ENGINE CUTTING WIDTH CSP

LZE600GKA484A2 Kawasaki® FX600V V-Twin 48" Series 4 (122cm) $8,999.99

LZE730GKAG604A3 Kawasaki® FX730V V-Twin 60" Series 4 (152cm) . $10,199.99 ]

LZE740EKC60400 Kohler® EVC740 Command™ EFI 80" Series 4 (152cm) $10,699.99
LZETA9EKCT2RAY Kohler® Eév749 Command™ EF 72" Rear Discharg $11,899.99
Deck (183cm) e

THE DEFINITION OF VALUE.

The E-Series is the perfect choice for professional landscape contractors who want the
innovative engineering and commercial-grade quality of a Lazer Z, but in a value package.
The E-Series features the same welded, heavy-duty, 1.5"x 3" tubular steel unibody frame
found throughout our Lazer Z models. You can also choose from two rugged Kawasaki®
V-Twin engines or a Kohler® Command™ EFl engine matched to 48-, 52-, 60-inch, full-
floating, UltraCut™ Series 4 cutting decks. A digital operator diagnostic module simplifies
system monitoring and troubleshooting, while the fue! gauge uses ultrasonic waves to
provide a more accurate reading. In short, the Lazer Z E-Series strikes a perfect balance
of value and performance. Now available with Rear Discharge.

OPTIONS: 12 VoIt Adapter » Equipment Cover ¢ Extended Drive Lever * Floor Pan Mat ¢ Harness Add-On
Kit  Hitch Kit ® Hydro Maintenance Kit ® Jack and Receiver ¢ Light Kit ® Power Deck Lift ® Sun Shade
Trash Container ¢ Air Ride Suspension Seat ¢ Full-Suspension Seat ¢ Tilt Frame & 3d Isolation System
Kit SIDE DISCHARGE ONLY: Operator Controlled Discharge ® Mulch Kit ® Three Bushel Bagger ® Turf
Striping Kite UltraVac Collection Systems REAR DISCHARGE ONLY: Finish Cut Baffles ¢ Side Wear Bar
Kit ® White Non-Marking Side Bumper

LAZER Z° S-SERIES

MODEL ENGINE CUTTING WIDTH ) CsP
® .

LZS749EKC60400 Kohler® ECV749 Command™ EFI 60" Series 4 (153cm) $11,899.99

LZS801GKA604A1 Kawasaki® FX801V V-Twin 60" Series 4 (153cm) $11,699.99

LZS740PKC72400 Kohler® PCV740 Command™ Propane

72" Series 4 (183cm) $14,899.99

ries 4 (183cm)

MORE POWER. MORE FEATURES. MORE PRODUCTIVITY.

With the S-Series, you can choose from three different engines, including an eco-friendly -

propane option. Three UltraCut™ Series 4 cutting deck sizes are available with widshs up to
72 inches.

OPTIONS: 12 Volt Adapter ¢ Equipment Cover ® Extended Drive Lever ¢ Floor Pan Mat » Harness Add-
On Kit » Hitch Kit » Hydro Maintenance Kit ® Jack and Receiver ® Light Kit ® Mulch Kit ® Operator
Controlled Discharge ® Power Deck Lift * Sun Shade  Trash Container ® Three-Bushel Bagger ® Turf
Striper e UitraVac Collection Systems ¢ Air Ride Suspension Seat * CustomRide Seat Suspension e Full-
Suspension Seat

‘y‘vtem ncre sclutch life. and |mpr'0veso rat
‘engagement, dusengagement..
M,




18/14/2815 23:35 . 9733341417 BOONTON POWER EQ PAGE ©1/01

T erAALA LT Ve s LR T

Invoice Estimate 85594

you for yol egs! We you soon. Recalpt ]
required for parts return, 15% re-stocking fee applies. Pleasa pressnt a copy
of our guote for us t honor any given price, quotes will ba honored for up to
30 days. ALL EQUIPMENT SALES ARE FINAL, ABSOLUTELY NO.
RETURNS OF ELECTRICAL PARTS, CLIMBING ROPES, OR SPECIAL
ORDER PARTS '

WRTE R o B SEa
BO6 2/ Avia., Boortorn AS 07'0‘::_'5

WARWICK DPW .
132 KINGS HWY i
Warwick, NY 10880 :

e R N e

Commil 7| GO A amReR -0 s prtane - . |- 5 AtEEHON
- (973) - (973) -

PRICE QUOTE Estimate

ROBERT CHANNELL 10M6/15 Counter Sales

]

N B

Description - 3+ { Ead
$10,900.00

GENERAL PART

$10,900.00
Invoice Total  510,900.00
Sales Tax $0.60

Grand thal $10,800.00

Thank you for your business! We hope to see you back seon. ltems must be retumed in the original package. A receipt is
requited for parts retumns and a 15% re-stocking fee may apply. '

Notes: f Customer acknowladges recelpt thereof:

ot dldie

BOONTON POWER EQUIPMENT Invoice Estimate # 85684 - WARWICK DPW Page 1 of 1




i sstimate Quotation _
o4 " | . Date:10/hu /18
PO OF ARG v Pades i 1

132 KINGS MIGHWAY , Sa lesparson: : 1
WARWICK . MEW YORK Estimates 13725
10980 s , Time: 1:22 PM
Qu@mtity tTbem Nurder thist Price 8als Mrioe o sEsctaresion| $Tx
1Ttem Descr-iptiom H H H 3 © 3
1,00 L2237 4980 2401 12580, 59 11099, 99 11OQQ,QBé ¥
Bw BENCTLG 728 LS BFT B
| ' Subtotal : 11099, 99
DUMBROWSKI 'S LAWN & SoRDEN CTR H
18 MEADOW ROSD Mert Total : 11099, 99
FLORTDA, WY 10921 Sales Tax : '
chobrwesld i @warw ik et Extimate Total: 11068, 89
inllalla) , CIMIESRINSICT . C20M
SLE~B5 177158




BASSANI POWER EQUIPMENT ' 10/15/15
103 STATE HIGHWAY 23
HAMBURG ,NJ 07419 Time: 11:49:34 AM
;973-875-1900
Order Date 10/15/15 ' Order #00151086 | PO#
Bill To: | Ship To:
845-986-3358
BILL ROE : :
14-6002490 WARWICK DPW Same
132 KINGS HIGHWAY '
WARWICK NY 10990
>>>>>5>>5>5>>>>>> PICK TICKET << << << < << << <gKK<
Part Number Description Bin Ord shp Bo Price Net Extension
EM LZS749AKC724Al 72 EFI/ SUSPENS SEAT 1 1 0 9900.00 9900.00 9900/ 00
EM . ) 0 0 0 0.00 0.00 0. 00
Regular  Order L
Back/Orders 0.00 Shipped Sub-Total 9900.00
B/0O Tax 0.00 Dep Balance 0.00 Shipped Sales Tax 0.00
B/O Total 0.00 Net B/O Due 0.00 Shipped Total 9900.00




ScanTastik

Located in Atlanta, Georgia

’W | McAfee
Y/ skcuRe’

Scansnap ix500
Deluxe

fi-6110

fi-6800

fi-59%0

7100 Network

fi-6010N Netwaork

Rack2-Fiter ]

# Fujitsu fi-7260 Flatbed scanner

Page 1 of 3

A trusted name in document

imaging since 1996, I

Call the experts
1-800-977-4935

Document Scanners | Large Format Scanners | MFP Devices |

Comparison chart | Kodak | Canon | Panasonic | Xerox | Fuiitsu | HP | Epson | Broth

FREE GROUND SHIPPING ON ALL SCANNERS OVER §599 {Continental US only)

(D

The Fujitsu fi-7260
scanner with flatbed

Scans 60 ppm/ 120 ipm
in Color, Grayscale, or Black & White.

Flatbed 8.5'x11.7" Scan Area

List Price
$1995

Your Price
$1259

Warranties

Care Kits/Parts

VRS or IPC?

Fujitsu fi-7260
Specifications

Function Specs
Color Charge Coupled Device (CCD) x 2
White LED Array

50 to 600 dpi in 1 dpi increments”
scanning limitations may occur at higher
dpi's based on PC configurations,

Image Sensor Type

Light Source

Optical resolution

Color: 24 bit, Grayscale; 8 bit

Output Format Monochrome:; 1 bit

Internal Video Processing 16-bit

Output Mode 50 to 600 dpi, 1200 dpi 2

Scanning speeds

Output (Letter / A4 size) simplex (ppm) / duplex (ipm)

Color, Grayscale, Black & White 300 dpi 60 ppm 120 ipm

Best Sellers

Kodak 11150
25/50 ipm
$375

Panasonic
KV-51026C
30 ppm/60 ipm
3Yr. Wty
$ 522

Kodak 2620
60 ppm/120 ipm
$ 869
3Yr. Wiy.

60 ppm/120 ipm
$ 825

KV-§1057C
65 ppm/130 ipm
$947
3 Yr. Warranty

i

Fuijitsu fi-7260
Flatbed scanner
60 ppm/120 ipm

$1259

http://www.scantastik.com/hardware/fujitsu-scanners/fujitsu-fi-7260.html?gclid=CKLhh-... 10/14/2015



Fajitsu fi-7260 (PA03670-B555) 24 bit CCD 600 x 600 dpi Duplex Image Scanner - New... Page 1 of 4
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TRY »  Free 30-day trial when you sign up for a 12-month membership.
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Shop All Stores ‘Keywords. Model # or ltem # . SBearch all SEARC Marketplace

. Home > Computer Hardware > Printers / Scanners & Supplies > Scanners > Document Scanners > Fujitsu > Item#: N82E16838115101

8 PRODUCT © TUjJILSU 1I=f ZOV S 005,
_ TOUR FU”TSU (PA03670-8555) 24 QTYA $1 290.00 ¢
bit CCD 600 x 600 | RALE
dpi Duplex Image ; Save: §705.99 (35%)
Scanner $9.99 Shipping ()
. Sold and Shipped by: .
Be the first to review this product,.. | Newegg
nsock | Protect Your Investment!

[ 2 Year Extended Repair Coverage $99.00

+ 60ppm/120ipm for ’ (more options)
color/grayscale/mono !
+ 80-page Automatic H . .
Li
Document Feeder (ADF) Add to Wish List Price Alert

LED light-source
Built-in flatbed (8.5" x
11.69")

Scanner Central Admin
Suite 1 ;
TWAIN & IS1S Drivers with &.

) -
HALLOWEEN HUB

{a
L
1]
»
‘%’

PaperStream

Coot Costurmes, Monsious Computer Stulf

. Ask Or Answer A Question | & Even Our Own Haunted House

. GolScary v
'. /,5’ May We Suggest
R ADVERTISEMENT
Fujitsu fi-7260 0 !
(PA03670-B555) 24 $1 ’290 0
bit CCD 600 x 600 dpi
CREATE A BUNDLE

¢ T w

HON Dell . ADATA
108679N E2414H . . DashDrive
Printer Black 24" uv100 :
i 00
$19127 |: $1799 i $G.4s Total: $1,290%
H i T } 3’ 2
oo oo 0 e §=¢;,> ARE YOU AN E-BLAST INSIDER?
: . [Enter Email Address | sunsonine
! Black ECS |
{ LIVA32GB !
! $109% | PayPal
! ‘ i; Shop without retyping payment details.

http://www.newegg.com/Product/Product.aspx?Item=N82E16838115101&nm_mc=KNC... 10/14/2015



. - Fujitsu £i-7260 - document scanner - PA03670-B555 - Document Scanners - CDW.com Page 1 of 4

" Write the first review

Hi, Log On or Create Acceunt Need Help? 800.800.4239 Quick Links v \_7 Cart (0)
More search options ¥
- - ; i l All Product Catalog ¥ | Search for... , [Q l
e Solutions & Services .| Account Center 1
Hardware Software Cloud Product Finders Brands Best Deals
Home > Printers, Scanners & Print Supplies » Document Scanners
(IR
Fujitsu fi-7260 - document scanner [1] swoso0
Mfg. Part: PAO3670-B555|COW Part: $1,416.99

oD
FUITSU 3223768 UNSPSC: 43211711 B Advertised Price

Lease Option{S44.21/month) -

Availability: in Stock

Shine tarav if ardered within 5 hre 84

+Document scanner

+Duplex

+8.5INx14in

+ 600 dpi x 600 dpi

»up to 60 ppm (mono) / up to 60 ppm (color)
+ ADF (80 sheets)

+up to 4000 scans per day

View More

Recommended Warranty

3 Yr Onsite Scanners {1200-1999.99) DOP

[:(Z] $101.99
Advertised Price

[ Add All items To Cart ]

Log On to Email this page or Save as Favorite

Customers Who Viewed This Product Also Viewed... (12)

Fujitsu fi-7280 - document Fujitsu fi-7180 - document Fujitsu fi-7160 - VRS Elite Fujitsu fi-6770 - document
scanner scanner ~document scanner scanner

kW k(0
$2,067.99 $1,653.99 $1,284.99 $5,962.00
Advertised Price Advertised Price Advertised Price Advertised Price

https://www.cdw.com/shop/products/Fujitsu-fi-7260-document-scanner/3223768.aspx?c... ~ 10/14/2015



